
Item Quantity Preferred Brand/ Model

Second Choice 

Brand/Model

Unit Cost / 

Preferred Extended Cost

Unit Cost / 

Second Choice

Unit Cost / 

Preferred Extended Cost

Unit Cost / 

Second Choice

Unit Cost / 

Preferred Extended Cost

Unit Cost / 

Second Choice

Instructional Equipment-Concert Band

Piccolo 3 Yamaha YPC 81 Yamaha YPC 62 $2,547.00 $7,641.00 $1,547.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $2,423.90 $7,271.70 NO BID

Oboe 2 Fox Model 330 Yamaha YOB-441 $3,194.74 $6,389.48 $2,718.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $3,032.90 $6,065.80 NO BID

Bassoon 2 Fox Renard Model 240 Fox Renard Model 220 $8,310.53 $16,621.06 $7,121.05 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $7,934.90 $15,869.80 NO BID

Tenor Sax 3 Yamaha YTS 480 Lacquer Style $1,997.00 $5,991.00 NO BID $0.00 $1,900.90 $5,702.70

Baritone Sax 2 Yamaha YBS 52 $4,278.00 $8,556.00 NO BID $0.00 $4,071.90 $8,143.80

French Horn 6 Conn 8D Connstellation Double Horn Yamaha YHR-668NII $3,579.02 $21,474.12 $3,571.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $3,299.90 $19,799.40 NO BID

Bass Trombone 2

Yamaha YBL 830 Xeno Bass 

Trombone

Bach 50B3 Stradivarius 

Series $3,654.00 $7,308.00 $3,721.37 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $3,488.90 $6,977.80 NO BID

Euphonium 4 Yamaha YEP 642II Yamaha YEP-321 $4,891.00 $19,564.00 $1,773.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $4,654.90 $18,619.60 NO BID

Bass Drum w/ stand 1

Adams 40 X 22 Concert Bass Drum 

with STBD Suspended Stand $2,383.00 $2,383.00 $2,299.00 $2,299.00 $2,231.90 $2,231.90

Concert Toms 1 Pearl PEA-PTE1314 $374.00 $374.00 $359.00 $359.00 $354.90 $354.90

Concert Toms 1 Pearl PEA-PTE1012 $348.00 $348.00 $335.00 $335.00 $330.90 $330.90

Timpani Set of 5 1

Adams 20/23/26/29/32" Professional 

Gen II Hammered Cambered Copper 

Timpani $17,359.00 $17,359.00 $16,750.00 $16,750.00 $17,003.90 $17,003.90

Crash Cymbal Cradle & Stand 2

Pearl C1030AC Orchestral Cymbal 

Cradle Stand $0.00 $0.00 $99.00 $198.00 $107.90 $215.80

Marimba 1

Adams 5.0 Octave Alpha Series 

Rosewood Marimba $11,955.00 $11,955.00 $11,859.00 $11,859.00 $11,511.90 $11,511.90

Chimes 1

Adams 1.5 Octave Symphonic Series 

Chimes (GEN2) $4,080.00 $4,080.00 $3,939.00 $3,939.00 $3,820.90 $3,820.90

Tam-Tam w/ stand 1

Zildjian 40" Traditional Orchestral 

Gong (Tam-Tam) $1,368.50 $1,368.50 $1,020.00 $1,020.00 $1,195.90 $1,195.90

Metronome 6 Korg DB90 $109.00 $654.00 NO BID $0.00 $86.90 $521.40

Drum Set 1

Pearl Decade 4 Piece Shell Pack w/20" 

Bass Drum - Faded Glory Finish $605.80 $605.80 $439.00 $439.00 $551.90 $551.90

trap Stand 2 PTT1824W $125.65 $251.30 $104.00 $208.00 $119.90 $239.80

Black Swamp Tambourine - Bronze 1

Black Swamp 10" Double Row 

Tambourine - TD2 $196.80 $196.80 $154.00 $154.00 $162.90 $162.90

Black Swamp Tambourine - Silver 1

Black Swamp 10" Double Row 

Tambourine - TD3 $201.60 $201.60 $158.00 $158.00 $165.90 $165.90

Black Swamp Artisan Triangle w/clip & beaters 1 Black Swamp Artisan Triangle Pack $282.00 $282.00 $219.00 $219.00 $241.90 $241.90

Black Swamp 08" Artisan Triangle 1

Black Swamp 08" Artisan Triangle - 

AT8 $90.67 $90.67 $76.00 $76.00 $77.90 $77.90

Black Swamp Triangle Clip 1 Black Swamp Triangle Clip - TRCLIP $56.00 $56.00 $45.00 $45.00 $48.34 $48.34

Dream Suspended Cymbal 3 Dream Vintage Bliss 22" - VBCRRI22 $0.00 $0.00 $125.00 $375.00 $194.90 $584.70

Dream Suspended Cymbal 2 Dream Vintage Bliss 20" - VBCRRI20 $0.00 $0.00 $97.00 $194.00 $150.90 $301.80

Concert Snare Drum 1 1

Black Swamp Pro 10 Maple Concert 

Snare Drum - 14x6.5 $676.80 $676.80 $405.00 $405.00 $577.90 $577.90

Concert Snare Drum 2 1

Black Swamp Mercury Series Snare 

Drum - Titanium SoundArt 14x4 

(SA414TDT) $937.60 $937.60 $769.00 $769.00 $803.90 $803.90

Dream Hand Cymbals 1 Energy 22" Orchestral Pair - A2E22 $0.00 $0.00 $339.00 $339.00 $480.90 $480.90

Dream Hand Cymbals 1 Energy 19" Orchestral Pair - A2E19 $0.00 $0.00 $239.00 $239.00 $327.90 $327.90

Dream Ride Cymbal 1 22" Contact Ride C-RI22 $0.00 $0.00 $149.00 $149.00 $205.90 $205.90

Dream Hi Hats 1 Dream 14" Bliss Hi Hats BHH14 $0.00 $0.00 $109.00 $109.00 $165.90 $165.90

Dream Splash Cymbal 8" 1 Dream Splash Cymbal 8" (BSP08) $0.00 $0.00 $39.00 $39.00 $35.54 $35.54

Dream Splash Cymbal 10" 1 Dream Splash Cymbal 10" (BSP10) $0.00 $0.00 $42.00 $42.00 $48.54 $48.54

Dream Splash Cymbal 12" 1 Dream Splash Cymbal 12" (BSP012) $0.00 $0.00 $44.00 $44.00 $62.64 $62.64

Pearl Suspended Cymbal Stand 6

Pearl BC820 Convertible Boom 

Cymbal Stand $46.67 $280.02 $35.00 $210.00 $32.94 $197.64

Black Swamp Woodblock 1

Black Swamp Rock Maple Woodblock - 

Lrg (MWB1) $45.60 $45.60 $37.00 $37.00 $37.84 $37.84

Pearl Drum Set Snare Drum Stand 2 Pearl S-1030 Snare Drum Stand $130.39 $260.78 $95.00 $190.00 $94.24 $188.48

Pearl Concert Snare Drum Stand 3 Pearl S-1030L Concert Snare Stand $140.00 $420.00 $102.00 $306.00 $104.90 $314.70

Pearl Rack Clamp 12 Pearl Rack Clamp - PCX100 $27.99 $335.88 $20.00 $240.00 $20.94 $251.28

Pearl Rack Clamp w/Tilt 4 Pearl Rack Clamp W/ Tilt -PCX200 $30.99 $123.96 $22.00 $88.00 $23.74 $94.96

Pearl Direct Drive Hi-Hat Stand 1

Pearl Direct Drive Hi-Hat Stand 

(H1050) $195.99 $195.99 $142.00 $142.00 $142.90 $142.90
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Pearl Roadster Drum Throne 1

Pearl Roadster Drum Throne 

(D1000SPN) $156.63 $156.63 $114.00 $114.00 $152.90 $152.90

Pearl Boom Cymbal Holder (Top Only) 8 Pearl CH-830 Boom Cymbal Holder $35.20 $281.60 $26.00 $208.00 $26.94 $215.52

Pearl Single Bass Drum Pedal 1

Pearl P-3000D Eliminator Demon 

Drive Single Bass Drum Pedal $258.85 $258.85 $189.00 $189.00 $208.90 $208.90

Gong Stand 1 Adams Gong Stand (4 wheel) $386.00 $386.00 $374.00 $374.00 $376.90 $376.90

Bar Chimes ("Wind Chimes") 1

TreeWorks Tre35db Classic Double-

Row 69 Bar Chime $267.20 $267.20 $159.00 $159.00 $174.90 $174.90

Bar Chime Bag 1

TreeWorks Tre51 Hard-Sided Gig Bag 

Chime Case $52.80 $52.80 $32.00 $32.00 $38.94 $38.94

Practice Pads 12

Innovative Percussion Black Corps 

Pad With Rim (CP-1R) $40.17 $482.04 $29.00 $348.00 $34.24 $410.88

LP Granite Blocks 1 LP Granite Blocks (LP1210) $177.49 $177.49 $141.00 $141.00 $149.90 $149.90

Drumset Bass Drum Bag 1

16x20 Humes & Berg Tuxedo Bass 

Drum Bag (TX508BD) $69.00 $69.00 $49.00 $49.00 $78.84 $78.84

Drumset Floor Tom Bag 1

14x14 Humes & Berg Tuxedo Tom 

Bag (TX503) $47.40 $47.40 $34.00 $34.00 $62.84 $62.84

Drumset Rack Tom Bag 1

8x12 Humes & Berg Tuxedo Tom Bag 

(TX425) $39.60 $39.60 $29.00 $29.00 $57.14 $57.14

Drumset Rack Tom Bag 1

8x10 Humes & Berg Tuxedo Tom Bag 

(TX489) $34.80 $34.80 $26.00 $26.00 $53.54 $53.54

Snare Drum Bag 1

5.5x14 Humes & Berg Tuxedo Snare 

Drum Bag (TX474) $38.97 $38.97 $28.00 $28.00 $56.44 $56.44
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Instructional Equipment-Marching

Bass Clarinet 4 Selmer 1430 LP $1,582.59 $6,330.36 NO BID $0.00 $1,462.90 $5,851.60

Mellophone 8 10-45 days King 1121 Ultimate Series $1,217.00 $9,736.00 NO BID NO BID $0.00 NO BID $1,168.90 $9,351.20 NO BID

Marching Baritone 8 Yamaha YBH 301 King 1124 Ultimate Series $1,677.00 $13,416.00 NO BID NO BID $0.00 NO BID $1,595.90 $12,767.20 NO BID

Sousaphone 6 Yamaha YSH 411SWC $6,834.00 $41,004.00 NO BID $0.00 $6,518.90 $39,113.40

Unitec Case 6 Unitec Sousaphone Case $649.99 $3,899.94 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Marching Snare 5

Pearl Championship Marching Snare - 

Black $486.00 $2,430.00 $469.00 $2,345.00 $459.90 $2,299.50

Marching Snare Carrier 5 Pearl CX Air Frame Snare Carrier $196.00 $980.00 $189.00 $945.00 $189.84 $949.20

Marching Snare Case 5 Pearl Marching Snare Case $79.00 $395.00 $76.50 $382.50 $93.90 $469.50

Pearl FFX Rehearsal Cover 5 Pearl FFX Rehearsal Cover Gray 14x12 $34.00 $170.00 $33.00 $165.00 $36.84 $184.20

Marching Tenors 6-10-12-13-14 3

Pearl Championship Marching Tenor 

Set - Black $925.00 $2,775.00 $893.00 $2,679.00 $637.90 $1,913.70

Marching Tenors Carrier 3 Pearl CX Air Frame Tenor Carrier $219.00 $657.00 $212.00 $636.00 $212.14 $636.42

Marching Tenors Case 3 Pearl Marching Tenors Case $148.00 $444.00 $143.00 $429.00 $154.94 $464.82

Pearl Marching Tenor Rehearsal Cover Gray 10,12,13,143 Pearl Marching Tenor Rehearsal Cover Gray 10,12,13,14 $46.00 $138.00 $45.00 $135.00 $49.84 $149.52

Marching Bass Drum 16" 1 Pearl PEA-PBDM1414/A46 - Black $377.00 $377.00 $364.00 $364.00 $341.90 $341.90

Pearl 16" Marching Bass Drum Cover - Gray 1 Pearl 16" Marching Bass Drum Cover - Gray $36.00 $36.00 $35.00 $35.00 $38.94 $38.94

Marching Bass Drum 18" 1 Pearl PEA-PBDM1814/A46 - Black $426.00 $426.00 $412.00 $412.00 $402.90 $402.90

Pearl 18" Marching Bass Drum Cover - Gray 1 Pearl 18" Marching Bass Drum Cover - Gray $36.00 $36.00 $35.00 $35.00 $38.94 $38.94

Marching Bass Drum 20" 1 Pearl PEA-PBDM2014/A46 - Black $458.00 $458.00 $442.00 $442.00 $433.90 $433.90

Pearl 20" Marching Bass Drum Cover - Gray 1 Pearl 20" Marching Bass Drum Cover - Gray $40.00 $40.00 $39.00 $39.00 $43.34 $43.34

Marching Bass Drum 24" 1 Pearl PEA-PBDM2414/A46 - Black $488.00 $488.00 $471.00 $471.00 $461.90 $461.90

Pearl 24" Marching Bass Drum Cover - Gray 1 Pearl 24" Marching Bass Drum Cover - Gray $44.00 $44.00 $43.00 $43.00 $47.74 $47.74

Marching Bass Drum 28" 1 Pearl PEA-PBDM2814/A46 - Black $556.00 $556.00 $537.00 $537.00 $525.90 $525.90

Pearl 28" Marching Bass Drum Cover - Gray 1 Pearl 28" Marching Bass Drum Cover - Gray $46.00 $46.00 $45.00 $45.00 $49.84 $49.84

Marching Bass Drum Carrier 5 Pearl Marching Bass Drum Carrier $201.00 $1,005.00 $194.00 $970.00 $194.64 $973.20

Marching Bass Drum Case 16" 1 PEA-PD1614 $83.00 $83.00 $80.00 $80.00 $86.94 $86.94

Marching Bass Drum Case 18" 1 PEA-PD1814 $87.00 $87.00 $84.00 $84.00 $91.14 $91.14

Marching Bass Drum Case 20" 1 PEA-PD2014 $102.00 $102.00 $99.00 $99.00 $106.94 $106.94

Marching Bass Drum Case 24" 1 PEA-PD2414 $123.00 $123.00 $119.00 $119.00 $128.94 $128.94

Marching Bass Drum Case 28" 1 PEA-PD2814 $130.00 $130.00 $125.00 $125.00 $136.24 $136.24

Stadium Series Snare Stand 5

Pearl MSS-3000 Marching Snare Drum 

Stand $127.00 $635.00 $123.00 $615.00 $132.90 $664.50

Stadium Series Tenors Stand 3

Pearl MTS-3000 Advanced Marching 

Tenor Stand $141.00 $423.00 $136.00 $408.00 $147.90 $443.70

Stadium Series Bass Drum Stand 5

Pearl MBS-3000 Advanced Marching 

Bass Drum Stand $140.00 $700.00 $135.00 $675.00 $146.90 $734.50

Microphones 8 Audio Technica AT2035 $129.99 $1,039.92 NO BID $0.00 $125.90 $1,007.20

Field PA System 1 Yamaha TF3 (24 ch) Mixer $2,299.99 $2,299.99 NO BID $0.00 $1,959.90 $1,959.90
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MegaVox Deluxe AIR Package Dual 2 MEGA-DPDUAL-AIR $2,099.99 $4,199.98 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Concert Bells 1 ADM-GAF33 $4,252.00 $4,252.00 $4,099.00 $4,099.00 $3,982.90 $3,982.90

Xylophone 1

Adams XS KF35 3.5 Octave Zelon 

With Field Frame $2,330.00 $2,330.00 $2,249.00 $2,249.00 $2,183.90 $2,183.90

Vibes 2 ADM-VCSF30M with Field Frame $4,130.00 $8,260.00 $3,985.00 $7,970.00 $3,867.90 $7,735.80

Marimba 3 ADM-MCKF43 with Field Frame $3,878.50 $11,635.50 $3,742.00 $11,226.00 $3,632.90 $10,898.70

Field Conducting Podium 2

DSI 6 Foot Command Center Podium 

# DC582 (Silver) $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $1,675.90 $3,351.80

Bid Notes

Total Award Amout Ken Stanton - $137,656.70

Total Award Amout Steve Weiss - $82,564.50

Total Award Amount Cascio Interstate - $3,351.80

Non Awarded Items: Alto Sax,Trombone,Tuba, Tuner, Piano,  

Aux Cart, Synth, Generator

Lead Times: As per section 2.7 of the special terms and conditions, FCS 

considered lead times when making award decsions. While Cascio Interstate may 

have have been low on select items, FCS awarded a shorter lead time.

Total Bid Award: $223,573.00


